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The film is based on the 1954 novel by famous Hindi author Sharat Chandra Chattopadhyay. The film, starring Manoj Kumar
and Nutan, is remembered for its music scored by the late A. R. Rahman. Overview Shor is Manoj Kumar's debut as a director.
It is based on the controversial novel, Nagamandala, written by Sharat Chandra Chattopadhyay, and the film won the National
Film Award for Best Feature Film. The film was also critically acclaimed, gaining the popularity of music director A. R.
Rahman. The film is about a young man, Arjun (Manoj Kumar), who is about to get married to a girl, Charu (Nutan), against
her will. The film's heroine takes a strong stance against her boyfriend's decision to marry her, as she has been coerced to do so
by her uncle. Despite his love for Charu, Arjun is forced to marry the same Charu, who has been adopted by her uncle as her
own daughter, though Charu is in reality not a child, but an adult. Arjun eventually does come to know the truth and has to take
a stand against his parents, uncle and Charu. As a result, he gives up his fiancée. Cast Manoj Kumar as Arjun Nutan as Charu
Jagdish Raj as Charu's uncle Bharat Bhushan as Arjun's father Benares Bannerji as Arjun's father Subhash Bhatnagar as Charu's
adoptive father Gurbachan Singh as Charu's adoptive father C.S. Dubey as Charu's adoptive father Raghubir Gaur as Charu's
adoptive father Asit Sen as Charu's adoptive father Girdhari as Charu's adoptive father B. M. Vyas as Charu's adoptive father
Urmila Bhatt as Charu's adoptive mother Songs All the songs of the movie are composed by A.R. Rahman and lyrics are by
Anand Bakshi. References External links Category:1972 films Category:Films directed by Manoj Kumar Category:Indian films
Category:Films scored by A. R. Rahman Category:1970s Hindi-language films Category:Directorial debut films// // Generated
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Jaya Bachchan ran into Manoj Kumar during the making of the film. She called him a bully and said that his "bharata" image
was just a show. He was sure that she admired him and invited her to premiere of her film. She did not accept his invitation,
saying that she was a Muslim, not a Hindu. He said that he could not understand her, since she herself admitted that she did not
believe in God. In 2004, Bachchan took part in the creation of the film "The Hindu" directed by Ravi Bhaduri, he played the
role of an Indian youth who went to an English school in London, but was also a staunch Hindu. became a hit with the film's
anthem, the evergreen song " Ek Pyaar. Author Â· Cinematography Â· Film . com As a child, I dreamed of becoming a
veterinarian and caring for animals. And now I just love the movie. It is worth watching for both adults and children. Highly
recommended for family viewing. The film tells the love story of a girl named Sarah and a young man named Raj. Raj is a guy
from a poor family, Sarah is a girl from high society. They go to school together. Raj can't buy Sarah candy like the other boys
because his mom won't let him spend his pocket money on sweets. fffad4f19a
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